
Since 2015, Malta Dynamics has supplied top-quality workplace 
safety gear directly to users. With over 600 field employees, we 
prioritize their needs, testing products extensively to ensure they 
meet real-world demands. This commitment has made us a 
leading name in safety, known for our Field Tested, Field Approved 
products.

MALTA HARNESS ACCESSORIES

PART # ACCESSORY WEIGHT

HEA1000 TREE STRAP .6 lBS

HEA2000 CLIMBING STRAP 1.4 lbs

HEA3000 SUSPENSION RELIEF .2 lbs

TREE STRAP

Our Tree Strap is crafted to accompany our complete line of Malta 
Hunting Harnesses perfectly. This strap is made with high-strength 
polyester webbing that won’t rip or tear and provides ideal friction 
to keep you safely attached to the tree. The strap allows you to 
anchor safely to the tree during your hunt. Tighten the tension 
buckle around the tree high enough to keep your harness tether 
taut when in a seated position, attach the tether to your harness, 
and safely hunt from all angles.

DEER DRAG/SUSPENSION RELIEF STRAP

Our Deer Drag/Suspension Relief Strap is a dual purpose hunting 
safety accessory. The strap has been designed to work seamlessly 
with our complete line of Malta Hunting Harnesses. Arresting an 
accidental fall is just the first step to making sure a hunter is safely 
rescued. In the time it takes to retrieve the fallen hunter, numerous 
secondary complications and injuries can occur. If a fall occurs, 
step into the loop located on the end of the Suspension Relief 
Strap and alternate standing on each foot to allow blood to keep 
circulating freely throughout the body. To use the strap as a Deer 
Drag, wrap the loop around the deer’s limb to create a slip knot and 
start your drag.

LINEMAN’S CLIMBING STRAP

Our Lineman’s Climbing Strap is crafted to accompany our 
complete line of Malta Hunting Harnesses perfectly. Using the strap 
allows you to safely climb a tree to install your tree stands or steps 
while keeping your hands free. The high-strength polyester strap is 
easily adjustable and features steel carabiners that attach directly 
to the sewn-in Lineman’s Loops on our Malta Hunting Harnesses. 
Wrap the strap around the trunk and adjust the tension using the 
steel buckle as you climb the tree.


